
Defining Love 
Love Rejoices In The Truth 

 
1 Corinthians 13:6 does not rejoice in iniquity, but rejoices in the truth; 
 

Rejoicing In The Truth About God 
 
Habakkuk 3:18 Yet I will rejoice in the LORD, I will joy in the God of my salvation. 
 
Psalm  33:21-22 For our heart shall rejoice in Him, Because we have trusted in His 
holy name. Let Your mercy, O LORD, be upon us, Just as we hope in You. 
 
Romans 5:2 through whom also we have access by faith into this grace in which we 
stand, and rejoice in hope of the glory of God. 
 
Romans 5:11 And not only that, but we also rejoice in God through our Lord Jesus 
Christ, through whom we have now received the reconciliation 
 

Rejoicing In The Truth Of The Word Of God 
 

John 16:13 However, when He, the Spirit of truth, has come, He will guide you into 
all truth; for He will not speak on His own authority, but whatever He hears He will 
speak; and He will tell you things to come. 
 
John 17:17 Sanctify them by Your truth. Your word is truth. 
 
Psalm 119:160 The entirety of Your word is truth, And every one of Your righteous 
judgments endures forever. 
 
Psalm 119:14 I have rejoiced in the way of Your testimonies, As much as in all 
riches. 

 
Psalm 119:162 I rejoice at Your word As one who finds great treasure. 
 
John 8:31-32 Then Jesus said to those Jews who believed Him, “If you abide in My 
word, you are My disciples indeed. And you shall know the truth, and the truth 
shall make you free.” 
 
1 Timothy 2:3-6 For this is good and acceptable in the sight of God our Savior, who 
desires all men to be saved and to come to the knowledge of the truth. For there is 
one God and one Mediator between God and men, the Man Christ Jesus, who gave 
Himself a ransom for all, to be testified in due time, 
 

Rejoicing In Jesus Christ 
 

Proverbs 16:6 In mercy and truth Atonement is provided for iniquity; And by the 
fear of the LORD one departs from evil. 
 
Psalm 25:10-11 All the paths of the LORD are mercy and truth, To such as keep His 
covenant and His testimonies. For Your name’s sake, O LORD, Pardon my iniquity, 
for it is great. 
 



John 1:17 For the law was given through Moses, but grace and truth came through 
Jesus Christ. 

 
Psalm 118:22-24 The stone which the builders rejected Has become the chief 
cornerstone. This was the LORD’s doing; It is marvelous in our eyes. This is the day 
the LORD has made; We will rejoice and be glad in it. 
 
John 14:6 Jesus said to him, “I am the way, the truth, and the life. No one comes to 
the Father except through Me. 
 
Philippians 4:4 Rejoice in the Lord always. Again I will say, rejoice! 
 

Rejoicing In The Salvation Of God 
 
Isaiah 25:9 And it will be said in that day: “Behold, this is our God; We have waited 
for Him, and He will save us. This is the LORD; We have waited for Him; We will 
be glad and rejoice in His salvation.” 
 
John 4:35-36 Do you not say, ‘There are still four months and then comes the 
harvest’? Behold, I say to you, lift up your eyes and look at the fields, for they are 
already white for harvest! And he who reaps receives wages, and gathers fruit for 
eternal life, that both he who sows and he who reaps may rejoice together. 
 
Luke 15:10 Likewise, I say to you, there is joy in the presence of the angels of God 
over one sinner who repents.” 
 
Luke 15:32 It was right that we should make merry and be glad, for your brother 
was dead and is alive again, and was lost and is found.’ ” 
 
2 John 4 I rejoiced greatly that I have found some of your children walking in truth, 
as we received commandment from the Father. 
 
3 John 3-4 For I rejoiced greatly when brethren came and testified of the truth that 
is in you, just as you walk in the truth. I have no greater joy than to hear that my 
children walk in truth. 
 
Psalm 13:5 But I have trusted in Your mercy; My heart shall rejoice in Your 
salvation.  
 
1 Peter 1:8-9 whom having not seen you love. Though now you do not see Him, yet 
believing, you rejoice with joy inexpressible and full of glory, receiving the end of 
your faith—the salvation of your souls. 
 
1 Thessalonians 2:19-20 For what is our hope, or joy, or crown of rejoicing? Is it not 
even you in the presence of our Lord Jesus Christ at His coming? For you are our 
glory and joy. 
 
Isaiah 26:2-3 Open the gates, That the righteous nation which keeps the truth may 
enter in. You will keep him in perfect peace, Whose mind is stayed on You, Because 
he trusts in You. 


